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Professor CHAN was appointed as the Under Secretary for Food and Health in November 2012 and participated in and 
responsible for policy formulation and promotion. Before joining the Government, Professor CHAN was a Professor in 
Nursing, Head of the School of Nursing and Director of Research at the University of Hong Kong (HKU). She was also an 
Assistant Dean of the Li Ka Shing Faculty of Medicine of HKU. 

Having trained in and practised general and paediatric nursing in Hong Kong and London, she read her Master of 
Education at the University of Manchester, Master of Public Health at the Harvard School of Public Health, and 
completed her doctoral studies at the HKU. Subsequently, she focused on teaching, research and administration in 
academia. Professor CHAN’s research is internationally recognised; she is awarded a Fellow of the Faculty of Public 
Health (through distinction), Royal College of Physicians of United Kingdom (FFPH (RCP)(UK)), and is the �rst nurse in 
Hong Kong being awarded the Fellow of the American Academy of Nursing (FAAN). Her paedagogy has been 
recognised by the award of the Faculty Teaching Medal in 2005 and the Outstanding Teaching Award in 2009, one of 
the highest honour for teaching achievements conferred by HKU.

Professor CHAN is one of the leading nurse scientists and her research specialises in public health, management of 
tobacco dependency and prevention of second hand smoke exposure in children, and proposes novel insights. Her 
team of investigators was one of the top funded researchers, and she published extensively in international journals on 
nursing, tobacco control, and public health. She consults widely nationally and internationally and has represented the 
University and the Food and Health Bureau in international meetings and invited by the World Health Organization to 
provide advice and leadership on their tobacco control initiatives.



Prof. John Ho Hung Chiu graduated from University of Hong Kong in 1940, after which he served in the army in China 
during the Paci�c War.  After the war he was in charge of the Lai Chi Kok Infectious Disease Hospital till 1946, then he 
pursued his career in the �eld of radiology. He obtained MRCP in 1947 and was elected Fellow of the Royal College of 
Physicians in 1963. Prof. Ho underwent training in radiology in UK in the 50’s, and he was amongst the few radiologists 
who obtained the double quali�cations in both diagnostic and therapeutic radiology conferred by the Royal College of 
Radiologists. 

Prof. Ho founded the Institute of Radiology & Oncology (IRO) in 1950 and had been the Consultant in-charge of the 
entire radiology service in Hong Kong Government, both diagnostic and therapeutic, until his retirement in 1985. Prof. 
Ho also founded the Hong Kong Anti-Cancer Society in 1963 and established the Nam Long Hospital which was the �rst 
hospital to provide palliative care and hospice service in Hong Kong. Because of his immense achievement, he was 
a�ectionately known as “Emperor Ho”.

Prof. Ho’s academic achievements were immense. He was internationally renowned for his work on the etiology, staging 
and radiotherapy of nasopharyngeal cancer. He delivered the 32nd Skinner Lecture to the Royal College of Radiologists 
in 1967; has been awarded the First Patrick Manson Gold Medal for his MD thesis on nasopharyngeal carcinoma in 1974; 
delivered the 6th Digby Memorial lecture in 1974; delivered the 1st del Regato Foundation Lecture in 1977; delivered the 
5th Annual Lecture to the Gilbert H. Fletcher Society in 1980; conferred by Queen Elizabeth II the CBE in 1985; awarded 
a Certi�cate of Appreciation by the UICC in 1990; delivered the �rst Werner Henle’s Memorial Lecture in 1996. He was 
the author of numerous textbooks and had published more than 150 original papers in most of the referred journals. He 
was also elected Honorary Fellow of Radiological Colleges of America, Australia/New Zealand, Canada and Hong Kong.
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